


Blockers: 

Each player can decide to use six to two blockers for 
two players (four to two blockers for three players, 3 to 2 
blockers when four players play – based on the player’s 
mastery of the game). During a match, a long string of 
“ready-to-be-closed” squares will be visible to players. 
Blockers help break up a squares chain, limiting a few 
squares or no squares for the opponent. Place a blocker 
on any unmarked (open) playing square. Don’t count 
squares occupied by blockers in the scoring. Placing 
your blocker and peg ends your turn.

To use a blocker, place it on an unmarked square 
before placing a playing stick on an adjoining open side. 
Blockers cannot be adjacent to another blocker; one 
square radius must surround a blocker. 

Scoring: 

At the end game (if scoring did not take place during 
play), each player totals their score by adding all 1-point 
(single), 2-point (double), and 3-point (triple) square they 
occupy. The player with the highest score wins.

Simple Strategic Hints: 

Limit the fewest number of squares to your opponent 
as is strategically possible. Keep the creation of long 
strings of squares (boxes showing parallel filled-in sides) 
to a minimum. Find a way to break them up early in the 
game, even if one must sacrifice a few boxes to their 
opponent. Note: the board will fill up faster than expected, 
so stay sharp and pay attention to the placement of 
playing sticks.

Use Blockers sparingly, strategically, and generally 
during the late middle to end of the game. Stay focused!
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